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Introducing Squamish Nation’s Climate Legacy Strategy 

The Squamish Nation is pleased to share our new Climate Legacy Strategy, a 
comprehensive framework aimed at advancing climate action within our Territory. This 
initiative reflects two years of community engagement, strategic planning, and data-driven 
analysis. Built on four pillars—Low-Carbon Infrastructure, Land and Water, Green Economy, 
and People and Community—the Strategy outlines 50 targeted actions designed to address 
the climate emergency. These actions range from promoting green infrastructure, 
protecting our land, and advancing climate resilience, all aligned with national and 
international climate goals for a net-zero future by 2050. 

The Climate Legacy Strategy presents an opportunity for government and private partners 
operating within Squamish Territory to support climate actions that align with Squamish 
Nation priorities, and enhance resilience for all who live, work and play in the Territory. 
This Strategy is also a tangible step toward reconciliation, guided by the principles of the 
United Nations Declaration on the Rights of Indigenous Peoples (UNDRIP). By collaborating 
on the Strategy, your organization can play a role in the responsible stewardship of our 
lands and waters, helping to meet United Nations and IPCC climate targets. Moreover, 
collaboration also provides an opportunity to further our shared climate goals and/or 
targets. 

We wish to develop successful partnerships in the implementation of this work.  If you wish 
to arrange for a meeting, please contact our Climate Action Manager – Julia Stafford 
(Julia_stafford@squamish.net). 

Thank you for considering this opportunity to join us in building a resilient, sustainable 
future. We look forward to your collaboration and support in realizing the ambitious vision 
of the Squamish Nation’s Climate Legacy Strategy.  Please view an online version of the 
Climate Legacy Strategy using the QR code below. 
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